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colleges courses in translation series of textbooks and the
Eleventh Five-Year national planning materials: University
English translation tutorial (3rd edition) the spirit of the theory in
close connection with the practical principles. highlighting
tutorial informative. practicality. and practical. The tutorial is
divided into three major parts the principle articles. tips. articles
and practice articles. Principle chapter succinctly describes the
translation standards and process differences between the
English and Chinese languages. In layman's language skills
articles expounded the commonly used techniques of English-
Chinese translation. Practice papers contain special Sentence
and business letters in English translation practices targeted.
Contents: The nature of the translation unit 1 Introduction 1.1 1.2
1.3 translation standard college English teaching to cultivate the
ability to translate requirements the Questions 2 unit translation
process 2.1 2.2 appropriateness correctly understand the
expression 2.3 meticulous checking thinking questions and
exercises Unit 3 English language of certain contrast 3.1 Chinese
and English word formation method contrast 3.2 Chinese and
English parts of speech divided and characteristics...
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A brand new eBook with a brand new standpoint. I could possibly comprehended everything out of this composed e
publication. Your life span will likely be enhance once you total reading this pdf.
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